
Notes on email correspondence between Hilda Hu (Sales Manager) of SAFS Steel Solutions 
and Repair Lab team member, February 22, 2024. 

• “1. Regarding the issue of dust inside the dome, since we are the material supplier, the 
specific operation of the equipment inside the dome will be calculated and tested by the 
owner's engineers, we need to provide the appropriate structure as well as materials in 
accordance with the owner's needs to ensure the safety as well as the stability of the 
building, and regarding the issue of the internal dust, we will do a good job in protecting 
the measures, but the specific way of dealing with it is still up to the customer to decide. 

• 2. Regarding the cost of coal silo, because our products are customized products, there 
are many factors affecting the price, we need to analyze and calculate according to the 
specific information of the project, in order to give a reference value of the price, there is 
no uniform pricing for the time being. 

• 3. We have rich experience in building dome coal silos, we have project experience in 
many countries, and we have built coal silos in countries with extreme weather without 
any safety problems so far, we hope that we can have the opportunity to cooperate, and 
we will show you the most competitive products.”  

Notes on email correspondence between Hilda Hu on February 27, 2024 

• “1. We are a professional steel structure manufacturer, mainly responsible for the 
production and transportation as well as the installation part of the project, at the same 
time, we will sign a confidentiality agreement to ensure the safety of the customer's 
project information, about the customer's project experimental testing we are not 
convenient to disclose for the time being. 

• 2. According to our past project experience, the cost of coal silo dome is about 70-120 
USD/m2, but the cost varies with different project size, mainly according to the structural 
form of the building, the size and the materials used, if you can provide part of the 
project information, I think we can estimate a more suitable reference cost. 

• 3. We have recently had a project of dome coal silo in the Philippines, the Philippines 
has more typhoons, so the requirement of structure is very high, and because of the 
proximity to the sea, there are some requirements for corrosion protection, so the cost 
will be a little higher than the ordinary dome coal silo. I have put our past project 
experience in the attachment below for your reference. I hope it will be helpful to you.”  

 


